
Full Boar <fullboarinc@gmail.com>

ABA payment
2 messages

Ashley Collinge <ash30303@bigpond.com> Fri, Mar 16, 2018 at 2:02 PM
To: Jennifer Hall <fullboarinc@gmail.com>
Cc: Mackay District Bowmen <mackayandistrictbowmen@gmail.com>

Hi Jennifer 
I have just paid the shoot fees for Mackay District Bowmen , that should be us paid up in full.Hopefully we will be able to keep it up to
date from now on in
Regards 
Ash Collinge
Treasurer Mackay District Bowmen 
Sent from my iPhone

IMG_0343.JPG
93K

Full Boar <fullboarinc@gmail.com> Sun, Mar 18, 2018 at 4:18 PM
To: Ashley Collinge <ash30303@bigpond.com>

Thanks Ash,
The image is very blurred - 
I will see it on the bank statement thought - when it eventually comes
what was the total deposit and for which months please? ((you can text me)
Jennifer Hall
Branch B treasurer
0414652889

On Fri, Mar 16, 2018 at 2:02 PM, Ashley Collinge <ash30303@bigpond.com> wrote:

Hi Jennifer
I have just paid the shoot fees for Mackay District Bowmen , that should be us paid up in full.Hopefully we will be able to keep it up to
date from now on in
Regards
Ash Collinge
Treasurer Mackay District Bowmen
Sent from my iPhone
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