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Re: Shoot fees payable to Branch

Subject: Re: Shoot fees payable to Branch

From: ABABranchB Treasurer <ababranchbtreasurer@gmail.com>
Date: 17/05/2022, 12:54 pm

To: CBHC <cbhc@antenna-tech.com.au>

CC: Jennifer Hall <treasurer@abafngbranchb.com>

Perfect Andreal!

Thanks for the email

That helps me with the end of financial year work by end of May

P.S. remember the new address is treasurer@abafngbranchb.com

| am on leave visiting my 2 granddaughters and back home 27th May.

Thats why I'm using the old email address to reply. | havent set up the new one on my phone yet... <
Jennifer Hall Treasurer ABA Branch B

On Tue, 17 May 2022, 12:16 pm CBHC, <cbhc@antenna-tech.com.au> wrote:
Hello Jennifer and Bec

Hope this email finds you well and enjoying the cooler weather!

| have prepared the bank transfers for our Club shoot fees to date in
2022. | will ensure that our reference for each deposit shows the month
it relates to.

January- no Shoot

February- $14.00

March  $14.00

April $20.00

May $18.00

Total $66.00

Brett has sent the Scores through each month which gives Branch B the
amounts due so | hope the details above are sufficient for your records.

Please let me know if you require further details.

Many thanks

Andrea Farraher
Treasurer
Collinsville Barebow Hunters Club

1/06/2022, 6:51 pm
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